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RADIOCOMMUNICATION ACT

Notice No. SMSE-002-08 — Amendment of RSS-191 and SRSP-
338.6 

Notice is hereby given that Industry Canada is releasing the 
following documents:

Radio Standards Specification 191 (RSS-191), Issue 3: Local 
Multipoint Communication Systems in the Band 25.3528.35 GHz; 
Point-to-Point and Point-to-Multipoint Broadband Communication 
Systems in the Bands 24.25-24.45 GHz and 25.05-25.25 GHz; 
and Point-to-Multipoint Broadband Communications in the Band 
38.6-40.0 GHz, which sets out certification requirements for local 
multipoint communication systems (LMCS), point-to-point and 
point-to-multipoint broadband communication systems in these 
bands; and

Standard Radio System Plan 338.6 (SRSP-338.6), Issue 3: 
Technical Requirements for Fixed Radio Systems Operating in the 
Band 38.6-40.0 GHz, which sets out technical requirements for 
licensing digital equipment in the fixed service for broadband 
wireless applications, including both point-to-point and point-to-
multipoint systems in the band 38.6-40.0 GHz. 

RSS-191, Issue 3 replaces Issue 2 and removes certification 
requirements for point-to-point broadband communication 
systems in the band 38.6-40.0 GHz. These requirements have 
been transferred to SRSP-338.6, Issue 3.

General information

The above-mentioned documents will come into force as of the 
date of publication of this notice.

These documents have been coordinated with industry through 
the Radio Advisory Board of Canada (RABC).

The Radio Equipment Technical Standards Lists will be amended 
to reflect the above changes.

Any inquiries regarding RSS-191 should be directed to the 
Manager, Radio Equipment Standards, 613-990-4699 
(telephone), 613-991-3961 (fax), res.nmr@ic.gc.ca (email). 
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Inquiries regarding SRSP-338.6 should be directed to the 
Manager, Fixed Wireless Communications, 613-952-4792 
(telephone), 613-952-5108 (fax), srsp.pnrh@ic.gc.ca (email). 

Interested parties should submit their comments within 120 days 
of the date of publication of this notice. Shortly after the close of 
the comment period, all comments received will be posted on 
Industry Canada’s Spectrum Management and 
Telecommunications Web site at http://ic.gc.ca/spectrum.

Submitting comments

Respondents are requested to provide their comments in 
electronic format (WordPerfect, Microsoft Word, Adobe PDF or 
ASCII TXT), along with a note specifying the software, version 
number and operating system used, to the following email 
address: res.nmr@ic.gc.ca.

Written submissions should be addressed to the Director General, 
Spectrum Engineering, 300 Slater Street, Ottawa, Ontario K1A 
0C8.

All submissions should cite the Canada Gazette, Part I, the 
publication date, the title, and the notice reference number (SMSE-
002-08).

Obtaining copies

Copies of this notice and of documents referred to are available 
electronically on Industry Canada’s Spectrum Management and 
Telecommunications Web site at http://ic.gc.ca/spectrum.

Official versions of Canada Gazette notices can be viewed at 
http://canadagazette.gc.ca/partI/index-e.html. Printed copies of 
the Canada Gazette can be ordered by calling the sales counter of 
Canadian Government Publishing at 613-941-5995 or 1-800-635-
7943.

March 19, 2008

ROBERT W. MCCAUGHERN
Director General

Spectrum Engineering Branch
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[15-1-o]

DEPARTMENT OF INDUSTRY

TELECOMMUNICATIONS ACT 

RADIOCOMMUNICATION ACT

Notice No. SMSE-005-08 — New issue of Telecommunications 
Regulation Circular TRC-49 

Notice is hereby given that Industry Canada is releasing a new 
issue of TRC-49: Telecommunications and Radio Equipment 
Service Fees of the Certification and Engineering Bureau (formerly 
known as Information on the Application of the 
Telecommunications Apparatus Technical Assessment and Testing 
Fees Order Made under the Financial Administration Act).

Changes in the new issue include

(a) new title for document TRC-49;

(b) updated fee structure from the Telecommunications and Radio 
Apparatus Fee Order;

(c) replacement of the Processing Flow Chart in Attachment I with 
Table of Fee Scenarios;

(d) removal of Attachment II, Industry and Science Canada 
Offices; 

(e) addition of Section 1.1, Public Inquiries with updated contact 
information; and 

(f) addition of Section 2, Related Documents.

This issue will come into effect upon publication of this notice.

Interested parties should submit their comments within 75 days 
of the date of publication of this notice. Shortly after the close of 
the comment period, all comments received will be posted on 
Industry Canada’s Spectrum Management and 
Telecommunications Web site at http://ic.gc.ca/spectrum.
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Submitting comments

Respondents are requested to provide their comments in 
electronic format (WordPerfect, Microsoft Word, Adobe PDF or 
ASCII TXT), along with a note specifying the software, version 
number and operating system used, to the following email 
address: telecom.reg@ic.gc.ca.

Written submissions should be addressed to the Deputy Director, 
Telecommunications Engineering and Certification, Industry 
Canada, 300 Slater Street, Ottawa, Ontario K1A 0C8. 

All submissions should cite the Canada Gazette, Part I, the 
publication date, the title, and the notice reference number (SMSE-
005-08).

Obtaining copies

Copies of this notice and of documents referred to are available 
electronically on Industry Canada’s Spectrum Management and 
Telecommunications Web site at http://ic.gc.ca/spectrum.

Official versions of CanadaGazette notices can be viewed at 
http://canadagazette.gc.ca/partI/index-e.html. Printed copies of 
the Canada Gazette can be ordered by calling the sales counter of 
Canadian Government Publishing at 613-941-5995 or 1-800-635-
7943.

April 11, 2008

R. W. MCCAUGHERN
Director General

Spectrum Engineering Branch

[15-1-o]

NOTICE OF VACANCY

NATIONAL ROUND TABLE ON THE ENVIRONMENT AND THE 
ECONOMY

Chairperson (part-time position) 

In the months and years ahead, the integration of environmental 
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